



February 19, 2019

Board of Public Works and Safety
City of Lafayette
20 N. 6th Street
Lafayette, IN 47901

Re: 2019 Chemical Awards for Lafayette Renew, WPCD, WWPL, Parks Department, and City of West Lafayette

RECOMMENDATION OF AWARD

Recommendation is being made to accept certain bids stemming from the bid opening held on Tuesday, February 12, 2019 as offered by the following suppliers for the particular chemicals and their respective pricing:

AWARDS TO:

<u>Supplier</u>	<u>Chemical</u>	<u>Price per U/M</u>
JCI Jones Chemical	Sodium Hypochlorite	\$0.75/gal.
Brenntag Mid-South	Sodium Bisulfite	\$1.397/gal.
	Hydrochloric Acid	\$118.00/drum
	Ferric Chloride	\$1.167/gal.
	Sodium Aluminate	\$2.56/gal.

The Board of Public Works and Safety has motioned, seconded and passed this recommendation all on this 26th day of February, 2019.

Gary Henriott, President

Cindy Murray, Member

Norm Childress, Member

Ron Shriner, Member

ATTEST:

Amy Moulton, Member

Mindy Miller, 1st Deputy Clerk Date

2019 Chemical Bid Tabulations
Sodium Hypochlorite, Sodium Bisulfite, Hydrochloric Acid, Ferric Chloride, Sodium Aluminate

Vendor:	<u>Brenntag</u>	<u>Jones Chemical</u>	<u>Alexander Chemical</u>	<u>Rowell</u>	<u>PVS Technologies</u>
Response:	On Time	On Time	On Time	On Time	Non-Responsive
Sodium Hypochlorite (per gallon)	\$0.833	\$0.750	4500 gal 0.7963 3500 gal \$0.84	\$0.849	
Sodium Bisulfite (per Gallon)	\$1.397	No bid	\$1.55	\$1.700	
Hydrochloric Acid (per Drum)	\$118.00	No bid	\$198.62	No bid	
Ferric Chloride (per gallon)	\$1.167	No bid	No bid	No bid	
Sodium Aluminate (per gallon)	\$2.560	No bid	No bid	No bid	
Lead Time: (Days ARO)	2-3 3 for FC & SB	2-3	2	2	
Evidence of Insurance	Yes	No	Yes	No	
Bid Bond	Yes	Yes	Yes	Yes	
Illegal Alien Affidavit	Yes	Yes	Yes	Yes	

NOTES:

55 gal drum
 Hydrochloric Acid is
 a 4 drum min

2018 Awards

Sodium Hypochlorite	Sodium Bisulfite	Hydrochloric Acid	Sodium Aluminate
\$0.75 per gallon	\$1.085 per Gallon	\$98.00 per Drum	\$2.48 per Gallon
		Ferric Chloride	
		\$0.925 per Gallon	

Vendor: PVS Chemical Kemira PVS Nolwood Webb Chemical Wilson Industrial
Response: Non-Responsive Non-Responsive Non-Responsive Non-Responsive Non-Responsive

Vendor: Sal Chemical KA Steel Chemicals Hydrite Chemical General Chemical Chemetrics
Response: Non-Responsive Non-Responsive Non-Responsive Non-Responsive Non-Responsive

Vendor: Univar
Response: Non-Responsive